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eTendering System Government of Kerala

Tender Details

Date : 06-Feb-2024 04:19 PM

4/26

DMOH-PTA/ 6@1%@%ﬁ%;s.kera]a. gov.in/nicgep/app?component=$DirectLink...

&5 Print
Basic Details
Organisation Chain Directorate pf Health Services| | District Medical Officer Pathanamthitta| | General Hospital
Pathanamthitta
Tender Reference
Nimibar 365/2024 GH PTA
Tender ID 2024_DHS_655036_1 Withdrawal Allowed Yes
Tender Type Open Tender Form of contract Supply
Tender Category Goods No. of Covers 1
General Technical No ItemWise Technical No
Evaluation Allowed Evaluation Allowed
. Is Multi Currency Allowed
Payment Mode Online For BOQ No
Is Multi Currency s =
Allowed For Fee No Allow Two Stage Bidding No
Payment Instruments Cover Details, No. Of Covers - 1
Online /s No [Bank Name Cover "
. Cover Document Type Description
mankacs 1 SBI MOPS No
Fee/PreQual
1 [Technical/Finance | BOQ
preliminary
agreement
.jpg printed on

200rs stamp

paper

GST

df RECEIPT
P FROM GST

DEPT
Tender Fee Details, [Total Fee in ¥ * - 12,000] || EMD Fee Details
Tender Feein € 12,000 EMD Amount in € |35,000 EMD Exemption |Yes
Fee Payable To  |Nil Fee Payable At |Ni Allowed
Tender Fee Yes EMD Fee Type fixed EMD Percentage |NA
Exemption EMD Payable To |Nil EMD Payable At |Nil
Allowed

Click to view modification history

Work /Item(s)
Title LAB AND BLOOD BANK REAGENTS AND CONSUMABLE ITEMS

Work Description Running contract for the supply of LAB AND BLOOD BANK REAGENTS and CONSUMABLES

Please refer Tender documents.

Pre Qualification
Details

Independent NA
External
Monitor/Remarks

1of3 06-02-2024 16:20
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588249/2024/CRU DMOHPTA

Tender Stage to Yes
disclose bid details
to other
bidders/public
domain
Tender Value in ¥ 80,00,000 Product Category Consumables | Sub category NA
(Hospital /
Lab)
Contract Type Tender Bid Validity(Days) |365 Period Of 30
Work(Days)
Location General Pincode 689645 Pre Bid Meeting NA
hospital Place
pathanamthitta
Pre Bid Meeting NA Pre Bid Meeting NA Bid Opening Place |GENERAL
Address Date HOSPITAL
PATHANAMTHITTA
Should Allow NDA  |No Allow Preferential No
Tender Bidder
Critical Dates
Publish Date 07-Feb-2024 09:00 AM |Bid Opening Date 23-Feb-2024 02:00 PM
Document Download / Sale 07-Feb-2024 09:00 AM | Document Download / Sale End |21-Feb-2024 06:00 PM
Start Date Date
Clarification Start Date NA Clarification End Date NA
Bid Submission Start Date 07-Feb-2024 09:00 AM | Bid Submission End Date 21-Feb-2024 06:00 PM
Tender Documents
NIT
Document |[|S.No |Document Name Description g;:“(?;e:;)
1 Tendernotice_1.pdf NOTICE 423.55!
Tendernotice_2.pdf GENERAL CONDITIONS 346.93
3 Tendernotice_3.pdf PRELIMINARY AGREEMENT 215.73
Work Item
Documents ||S.No Document Type Document Name Description :;:u(r;:'e:ta)
1 Tender Documents preliminaryagreementLAB.pdf |AGREEMENT 199.35
2 BOQ BOQ_1010807.xls BOQ 377.00
Bi ners Li
S.No Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Certificate Name
1, drsushpk@gmail.com SUSHAMA P K Sushama P K
: i ABDUL AZEEZ POOMANNIL
2. shiyaazeez@gmail.com ABDUL AZEEZ P A ABDUL WAHAB
3. dssubiraj@gmail.com SUBIRAID S g.LI.JEBlT:J SRA
P i
Auto Tendering No Show Technical bid status Yes
Process allowed
Show Finance bid Yes Show Bid Details in Public Technical Bid Opening
status Domain stage
BoQ Comparative Normal BoQ Compartive chart decimal [3
Chart model places

2 of 3 06-02-2024 16:20
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BoQ Comparative \L Form Based BoQ No
Chart Rank Type
Name SUPERINTENDENT
Address GENERAL HOSPITAL PATHANAMTHITTA
r Detai
Created By SUSHAMA P K
Designation DEPUTY DIRECTOR
Created Date 06-Feb-2024 11:52 AM
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eTendering System Government of Kerala

Tender Details

Date : 06-Feb-2024 04:18 PM

&5 Print

Basic Details

—

Organisation Chain

Directorate of Health Services

| | District Medical Officer Pathanamthitta| | General Hospital

Pathanamthitta

Tender Reference

Miiibae A3-398/2024 GH PTA

Tender ID 2024_DHS_655165_1 Withdrawal Allowed Yes

Tender Type Open Tender Form of contract Supply

Tender Category Goods No. of Covers 1

General Technical No ItemWise Technical No

Evaluation Allowed Evaluation Allowed

2 Is Multi Currency Allowed

Payment Mode Online For BOQ No

Is Multi Currency e

Allowed For Fee No Allow Two Stage Bidding No

Payment Instruments Cover Details, No. Of Covers - 1 7

Online

Seuricars S.No_|Bank Name i Sover Cover Document Type Description

1 |sBIMops B
Fee/PreQual
1 /Technical/Finance s .
preliminary
agreement
.pdf printed on
200rs stamp
paper
gst receipt
.pdf from GST

department

Tender Fee Details, [Total Fee in T * - 25,Dgﬂ] EMD Fee Details

Tender Feein ¥ (25,000 EMD Amount in ¥ |50,000 EMD Exemption |Yes

Fee Payable To  |Nil Fee Payable At |Nil Allowed

Tender Fee Yes EMD Fee Type fixed EMD Percentage |NA

Exemption ’ EMD Payable To |Nil EMD Payable At N|'I_I

Allowed

Click to view modification history

Work /Item(s)

]

Title

CATHLAB CONSUMABLES CONSIGNMENT ITEMS

Work Description

Rate contract for the supply of CATH LAB CONSUMABLES CONSIGNMENT ITEMS

Pre Qualification
Details

Please refer Tender documents.

disclose bid details

B other

Independent NA
External
Monitor/Remarks
Tender Stage to Yes

]

06-02-2024 16:18
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)
bidders/public
domain
Tender Value in ¥ 5,00,00,000 Product Category Consumables | Sub category NA
(Hospital /
Lab)
Contract Type Tender Bid Validity(Days) |365 Period Of 30
i Work(Days)
Location General Pincode 689645 Pre Bid Meeting NA
hospital Place
pathanamthitta
Pre Bid Meeting NA Pre Bid Meeting NA Bid Opening Place |GENERAL
| Address Date HOSPITAL
PATHANAMTHITTA
Should Allow NDA [No Allow Preferential No
Tender Bidder
Critical Dat
| Publish Date 07-Feb-2024 09:00 AM |Bid Opening Date 23-Feb-2024 09:00 AM
Document Download / Sale 07-Feb-2024 09:00 AM |Document Download / Sale End |21-Feb-2024 06:00 PM
. Start Date Date
Clarification Start Date NA Clarification End Date NA
Bid Submission Start Date 07-Feb-2024 05:00 PM |Bid Submission End Date 21-Feb-2024 06:00 PM
Tender Documents
NIT
Gooy Document
Document ||S.No|Document Name Description Size (in KB)
| 1 Tendernotice_1.pdf notice 385.98
2 Tendernotice_2.pdf general conditions 348.43
Work Item
oS Document
Documents ||S.No Document Type Document Name Description size (in KB)
1 Tender Documents PRELIMINARYAGREEMENT.pdf |preliminary agreement 200.17
2 Tender Documents GENRALCONDITION. pdf general conditions 332.02
3 BOQ |BOQ_1011064.xls BOQ 691.00,
| Bid O List
' S.No Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Certificate Name
| 1. drsushpk@gmail.com SUSHAMA P K Sushama P K
’ ; ABDUL AZEEZ POOMANNIL
7.3 shiyaazeez@gmail.com ABDUL AZEEZ P A ABDUL WAHAB
e ; SUBIRAJ DARMARAJ
3. dssublraj@gmall_.com ISUBIRAID S STELLA
T r i
Auto Tendering No Show Technical bid status Yes
Process allowed
Show Finance bid Yes Show Bid Details in Public Technical Bid Opening
status Domain stage
BoQ Comparative Normal BoQ Compartive chart decimal |3
Chart model places
BoQ Comparative L Form Based BoQ No
Chart Rank Type
20f3 06-02-2024 16:18
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@

Tender Inviting Authority
Name SUPERINTENDENT
Address GENERAL HOSPITAL PATHANAMTHITTA
Tender Creator Details
Created By SUSHAMA P K

| Designation DEPUTY DIRECTOR

‘ Created Date 06-Feb-2024 02:04 PM

|

3of3

06-02-2024 16:18
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Tender Details

Date : 06-Feb-2024 04:21 PM

¢, Print
Basic Details
o Etilon Chaln Directorate of Health Services| | District Medical Officer Pathanamthitta| | General Hospital
pRasuon Pathanamthitta
Tender Reference
Mumbiar A3-397/2024 GH PTA
Tender ID 2024_DHS_654989_1 Withdrawal Allowed Yes
Tender Type Open Tender Form of contract Supply
Tender Category Goods No. of Covers 1
General Technical No ItemWise Technical No
Evaluation Allowed Evaluation Allowed
. Is Multi Currency Allowed
Payment Mode Online For BOQ No
Is Multi Currency sua s
Allowed For Fee No - Allow Two Stage Bidding No
Payment Instruments Cover Details, No. Of Covers - 1
Online
Bankers S.No |Bank Name gover Cover Document Type Description
1 SBI MOPS o
200rs stamp
paper printed
1 Fee/PreQual of with
/Technical/Finance | P preliminary
agreement
format
Xls BOQ
RECEIPT
.pdf FROM GST
DEPARTMENT
Tender Fee Details, [Total Fee in ¥ * - 16,000] || EMD Fee Details
Tender Feein ¥ 16,000 EMD Amount in ¥ (30,000 EMD Exemption |Yes
Fee Payable To  |Nil Fee Payable At |Ni Allowed
Tender Fee Yes EMD Fee Type fixed EMD Percentage |NA
Exemption EMD Payable To |Nil EMD Payable At |Nil
Allowed
Click to view modification history
Work /Item(s)
Title CATHLAB CONSUMABLES PURCHASE ITEMS

Work Description

RUNNING CONTRACT FOR THE SUPPLY OF CATH LAB CONSUMABLES PURCHASE ITEMS

Pre Qualification
Details

Please refer tender documents

disclose bid details
to other

Independent NA
External
Monitor/Remarks
Tender Stage to Yes

12/26
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ﬁ
bidders/public
domain
Tender Value in ¥ 1,00,00,000 Product Category Consumables | Sub category NA
(Hospital /
Lab)
Contract Type Tender Bid Validity(Days) |365 Period Of 30
Work(Days)
Location General Pincode 689645 Pre Bid Meeting NA
hospital Place
pathanamthitta
Pre Bid Meeting NA Pre Bid Meeting NA Bid Opening Place |GENERAL
Address Date HOSPITAL
PATHANAMTHITTA
Should Allow NDA |No Allow Preferential No
Tender Bidder

Critical Dat

Publish Date

06-Feb-2024 04:21 PM

Bid Opening Date

23-Feb-2024 09:00 AM

Start Date

Document Download / Sale

07-Feb-2024 09:00 AM

Document Download / Sale End
Date

21-Feb-2024 06:00 PM

Clarification Start Date

NA

Clarification End Date

NA

Bid Submission Start Date

07-Feb-2024 09:00 AM

Bid Submission End Date

21-Feb-2024 06:00 PM

Tender Docum
NIT
& Document
Document [|S.No|Document Name Description size (in KB)
1 Tendernotice_1.pdf PRELIMINARY AGREEMENT 216.23
2 Tendernotice_2.pdf TENDER NOTICE 423.54
3 Tendernotice_3.pdf GENERAL CONDITIONS 348.37
Work Item
. Document
Documents ||S.No|Document Type Document Name Description Size (in KB)
PRELIMINARY
1 Tender Documents PRELIMINARYAGREEMENT. pdf AGREEMENT 199.85
2 Tender Documents GENERALCONDITIONS. pdf GENERAL CODITIONS 331.96
3 BOQ BOQ_1010721.xls bog 387.00
Bid O List
S.No Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Certificate Name
1: drsushpk@gmail.com SUSHAMA P K Sushama P K
. ABDUL AZEEZ POOMANNIL
2. shiyaazeez@gmail.com ABDUL AZEEZ P A ABDUL WAHAB
" - g SUBIRAJ DARMARAJ
3, dssubiraj@gmail.com SUBIRAID S STELLA
Tender Properties
Auto Tendering No Show Technical bid status Yes
Process allowed
Show Finance bid Yes Show Bid Details in Public Technical Bid Opening
status Domain stage
BoQ Comparative Normal BoQ Compartive chart decimal 3
Chart model places
BoQ Comparative L Form Based BoQ No
Chart Rank Type

06-02-2024 16:21
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024/CRU DMOHPTA
Name SUPERINTENDENT
Address General hospital pathanamthitta
Tender Creator Details:
Created By SUSHAMA P K
Designation DEPUTY DIRECTOR
Created Date 06-Feb-2024 10:59 AM
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58824202 AHSRY BMERPIA of Kerala https://etenders.kerala.gov.in/nicgep/app?componcnt $Dircetl ink...
N
\ ® N
eTendering System Government of Kerala
o Tender Details
b L Date : 06-Feb-2024 04:21 PM
¢ Print
Basic Details
. Directorate of Health Services| | District Medical Officer Pathanamthitta| | General Hospital
Organisation Chain Pathanamthitta
Tender Reference
Nismbiar A3-397/2024 GH PTA
Tender ID 2024_DHS_654989 1 Withdrawal Allowed Yes
Tender Type Open Tender Form of contract Supply
Tender Category Goods No. of Covers L
General Technical No ItemWise Technical No
Evaluation Allowed Evaluation Allowed
) Is Multi Currency Allowed
Payment Mode Online For BOQ No
Is Multi Currency ek
Allowed For Fee No - Allow Two Stage Bidding No
Payment Instruments Cover Details, No. Of Covers - 1
Online /s No [Bank Name Cover
e Cover Document Type Description
Bankers | TsaI MOPS a
200rs stamp
paper printed
1 Fee/PreQual df with
/Technical/Finance ) preliminary
agreement
format
xls BOQ
RECEIPT
pdf FROM GST
DE
. PARTM%
ender Fee Details, [Total Fee in ¥ * - 16,000 EMD Fee Details
Tender Feein ¥ (16,000 EMD Amount in ¥ |30,000 EMD Exemption |Yes
Fee PayableTo  |Nil Fee Payable At |Ni Allowed
Tender Fee Yes EMD Fee Type fixed EMD Percentage |NA
Exemption EMD Payable To |Nil EMD Payable At |Nil
Allowed
Click to view modification history \
Work /Item(s)
Title CATHLAB CONSUMABLES PURCHASE ITEMS
Work Description RUNNING CONTRACT FOR THE SUPPLY OF CATH LAB CONSUMABLES PURCHASE ITEMS
Pre Qualification Please refer tender documents
Details
Independent NA
External
Monitor/Remarks
Tender Stage to Yes
disclose bid details
to other

i’ 3 NE NI 2074 12.11
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DMOH-PTA/6 %%Q%é;'ﬁé%kcrala. gov.in/nicgep/app?component=$DirectLink...

588249/2024/CRU DMOHPTA
1
| bidders/public
domain
Tender Value in ¥ 1,00,00,000 Product Category Consumables | Sub category NA
(Hospital /
Lab)
Contract Type Tender Bid Validity(Days) |365 Period Of
- Work(Days)
Location General Pincode 689645 Pre Bid Meeting NA
hospital Place
pathanamthitta
Pre Bid Meeting NA Pre Bid Meeting NA Bid Opening Place |GENERAL
Address Date HOSPITAL
PATHANAMTHITTA
Should Allow NDA |No Allow Preferential No
Tender Bidder
Critical Dat
Publish Date 06-Feb-2024 04:21 PM  {Bid Opening Date 23-Feb-2024 09:00 AM
Document Download / Sale 07-Feb-2024 09:00 AM |Document Download / Sale End |21-Feb-2024 06:00 PM
Start Date Date
Clarification Start Date NA Clarification End Date NA
Bid Submission Start Date 07-Feb-2024 09:00 AM |Bid Submission End Date 21-Feb-2024 06:00 PM

17/26

Tender Documents
NIT
i Document

Document ||S.No|Document Name Description Size (in KB)

1 Tendernotice_1.pdf PRELIMINARY AGREEMENT 216.23

2 Tendernotice_2.pdf [TENDER NOTICE 423.54

3 Tendernotice_3.pdf GENERAL CONDITIONS 348.3
Work Item

- Document
Documents ||S.No|Document Type Document Name Description size (in KB)
PRELIMINARY

1 TenderkDocuments PRELIMINARYAGREEMENT. pdf AGREEMENT 199.85

2 Tender Documents GENERALCONDITIONS. pdf GENERAL CODITIONS 331.96 |

3 |BoQ BOQ_1010721.xis bog 387.00 |

|

S.No Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Certificate Name
18 drsushpk@gmail.com SUSHAMA P K Sushama P K

. : ABDUL AZEEZ POOMANNIL|
2, hiyaazeez@gmail.com ABDUL AZEEZ P A ABDUL WAHAB

er L SUBIRAJ DARMARAJ

3 dssubiraj@gmail.com SUBIRAID S STELLA
Auto Tendering No Show Technical bid status Yes
Process allowed
Show Finance bid Yes Show Bid Details in Public Technical Bid Opening |
status Domain stage
BoQ Comparative Normal BoQ Compartive chart decimal 3
Chart model places
BoQ Comparative L Form Based BoQ No
Chart Rank Type

06-02-2024 16:21
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. /et k -.gov.in/nicgep/app? =$Di ink...
588249/2024/CRU BNVEERSTAOf Kerala https://etenders kerala gov.in/nicgep/app?component=$DirectL ink

h

Name SUPERINTENDENT

Address General hospital pathanamthitta

Created By SUSHAMA P K

Designation DEPUTY DIRECTOR

Created Date 06-Feb-2024 10:59 AM =
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BOEMEInH - AIMIEInH-
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Al@Mo®|g , BaNO6M :~ 9497713258
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:n;—;g;:: j—3:31;/_2024 ol : 05.02.2024

& - asmawd emaglmd

(CATHLAB CONSUMABLES : CONSIGNMENT ITEMS)
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588%@%%@W%ﬁ@ﬁmm of Kerala
eTendering System Government of Kerala
Tender Details
Date : 06-Feb-2024 04:18 PM
&5 Print
Basic Details
Directorate of Health Services| | District Medical Officer Pathanamthitta| | General Hospital
Organisation Chain Pathanamthitta
Tender Reference
Number A3- 398/2024 GH PTA
Tender ID 2024_DHS_655165_1 Withdrawal Allowed Yes
Tender Type Open Tender Form of contract Supply
Tender Category Goods No. of Covers 1
General Technical No ItemWise Technical No
Evaluation Allowed Evaluation Allowed
: Is Multi Currency Allowed
Payment Mode Online For BOQ No
Is Multi Currency .
Allowed For Fee No Allow Two Stage Bidding No
Payment Instruments Cover Details, No. Of Covers - 1
Online
Bankers S:No Bank Name ::‘over Cover Document Type Description
1 SBI MOPS =
Fee/PreQual
1 /Technical/Finance s 80Q
preliminary
agreement
.pdf printed on
200rs stamp
paper
gst receipt
.pdf from GST
department
L]
ender Fee Details tal Fee in ¥ * - 25,000 D Fee Details
Tender Fee in € (25,000 EMD Amount in ¥ |50,000 EMD Exemption |Yes
Fee Payable To Nil Fee Payable At ]Nir Allowed
Tender Fee Yes EMD Fee Type fixed EMD Percentage |NA
Exemption 4 EMD Payable To |Nil EMD Payable At |Nil
Allowed
Click to view modification history
wgrk [I;gml §l
Title CATHLAB CONSUMABLES CONSIGNMENT ITEMS
Work Description Rate contract for the supply of CATH LAB CONSUMABLES CONSIGNMENT ITEMS
Pre Qualification Please refer Tender documents,
Details
Independent NA
External
Monitor/Remarks
Tender Stage to Yes
disclose bid details
to other

of 3

20/26
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f3

-PTA/600/2024-B1
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(]
bidders/public
domain
Tender Value in ¥ 5,00,00,000 Product Category Consumables | Sub category NA
(Hospital /
Lab)
Contract Type Tender Bid Validity(Days) |[365 Period Of 30
’ Work(Days)
Location General Pincode 689645 Pre Bid Meeting NA
hospital Place
pathanamthitta
Pre Bid Meeting NA Pre Bid Meeting NA Bid Opening Place |GENERAL
Address Date HOSPITAL
PATHANAMTHITTA
Should Allow NDA | No Allow Preferential [No
Tender Bidder

Critical Dat
Publish Date 07-Feb-2024 09:00 AM |Bid Opening Date 23-Feb-2024 09:00 AM
Document Download / Sale 07-Feb-2024 09:00 AM |Document Download / Sale End |21-Feb-2024 06:00 PM
Start Date Date
Clarification Start Date NA Clarification End Date NA
Bid Submission Start Date 07-Feb-2024 05:00 PM  |Bid Submission End Date 21-Feb-2024 06:00 PM
T r Docum
NIT
ST Document
Document | S.No|Document Name Description Size (in KB)
1 Tendernotice_1.pdf notice 385.98
Tendernotice_2.pdf general conditions 348.43
Work Item
o Document
Documents ||S.No |Document Type Document Name Description size (in KB)
1 Tender Documents PRELIMINARYAGREEMENT.pdf preliminary agreement 200.17
[Tender Documents GENRALCONDITION, pdf eneral conditions 332.02
3 BOQ * BOQ_1011064.xIs BOQ 691.00
Bid O List
S.No Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Certificate Name
1. drsushpk@gmail.com SUSHAMA P K Sushama P K
2 i ABDUL AZEEZ POOMANNIL
2 hiyaazeez@gmail.com ABDUL AZEEZ P A ABDUL WAHAB
. ) SUBIRAJ DARMARAJ
3. dssublraj@gmaﬂ:com SUBIRAID S STELLA
Tender Properties
Auto Tendering No Show Technical bid status Yes
Process allowed
Show Finance bid Yes Show Bid Details in Public Technical Bid Opening
status Domain stage
BoQ Comparative Normal BoQ Compartive chart decimal |3
Chart model places
BoQ Comparative L Form Based BoQ No
Chart Rank Type

21/26
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! DMOH-PTA/600/2024-B1
588249/2024/CRit GMENRTA of Kerala

-~

https:

/letenders.kerala. gov.in/nicgep/app?component=$DirectLink..,

[‘I ler Inviting Authorit

Name ,SUPERINTENDENT
Address GENERAL HOSPITAL PATHANAMTHITTA

[ Tender creator Detaits

Created By SUSHAMA P K
Designation DEPUTY DIRECTOR

Created Date 06-Feb-2024 02:04 PM
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(LAB & BLOOD BANK RE-AGENTS)
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https://etcnders.kerala.gov.in/nicgep/app?component=$DirectLink...

eTendering System Government of Kerala

Tender Details

Date : 06-Feb-2024 04:19 PM

€ Print

Basic Details

=

Organisation Chain

Directorate of Health Services

Pathanamthitta

| | District Medical Officer Pathanamthitta| | General Hospital

Tender Reference
Number

365/2024 GH PTA

Tender ID 2024_DHS_655036_1 Withdrawal Allowed Yes

Tender Type Open Tender Form of contract Supply

Tender Category Goods No. of Covers |

General Technical No ItemWise Technical No

Evaluation Allowed Evaluation Allowed

3 Is Multi Currency Allowed

Payment Mode Online For BOQ No

Is Multi Currency T

Allowed For Fee No Allow Two Stage Bidding No

Payment Instruments Cover Details, No. Of Covers - 1

Online /5 No ™ [Bank Name Cover :

- Cover Document Type Description
Bankers |l st Mops fie
Fee/PreQual
1 [Technical/Finance | B
preliminary
agreement
Jjpg printed on
200rs stamp
paper
GST
b RECEIPT
HF FROM GST

DEPT

Tender Fee Details, [Total Fee in ¥ * - 12,000] || EMD Fee Details

Tender Feein ® {12,000 EMD Amount in ¥ |35,000 EMD Exemption |Yes

Fee Payable To Fee Payable At |Ni Aloired

Tender Fee Yes EMD Fee Type fixed EMD Percentage |NA

Exemption EMD Payable To |Nil EMD Payable At |Nil

Allowed

Click to view modification history

Work /Item(s)

Title

LAB AND BLOOD BANK REAGENTS AND CONSUMABLE ITEMS

Work Description

Running contract for the supply of LAB AND BLOOD BANK REAGENTS and CONSUMABLES

Pre Qualification
Details

Please refer Tender documents.

Independent
External
Monitor/Remarks

NA
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-ument of Kerala
588249/202%RU DMOHPTA

Tender Stage to Yes
disclose bid details
to other
bidders/public
domain
Tender Value in ¥ 80,00,000 Product Category Consumables | Sub category NA
(Hospital /
Lab)
Contract Type Tender Bid Validity(Days) 365 Period Of 30
Work(Days)
Location General Pincode 689645 Pre Bid Meeting NA
hospital Place
pathanamthitta
Pre Bid Meeting NA Pre Bid Meeting NA Bid Opening Place GENERAL
Address Date HOSPITAL
PATHANAMTHITTA
Should Allow NDA |No Allow Preferential |No
Tender Bidder

Critical Dates
Publish Date

Document Download -/ Sale
Start Date

Clarification Start Date NA
Bid Submission Start Date 07-Feb-2024 09:00 AM

07-Feb-2024 09:00 AM
07-Feb-2024 09:00 AM

Bid Opening Date 23-Feb-2024 02:00 pM

Document Download / Sale End 21-Feb-2024 06:00 PM
Date

Clarification End Date NA
Bid Submission End Date 21-Feb-2024 06:00 pM

NIT
. Document

Document ||S.No |Document Name Description Size (in KB)

1 Tendernotice_1.pdf NOTICE : 423.55

2 Tendernotice_z.pdf GENERAL CONDITIONS 346.93,

3 Tendernotice_3.pdf PRELIMINARY AGREEMENT 215.73
Work Item

; o Document

Documents ||S.No |Document Type Document Name Description Size (in KB)

1 Tender Documents preliminaryagreementLAB.pdf AGREEMENT 199.35

2 BOQ BOQ_1010807.xls BOQ 377.00
Bid Openers List
S.No Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Certificate Name
1. drsushpk@gmail.com SUSHAMA P K Sushama P K

3 0 ABDUL AZEEZ POOMANNIL
2, hiyaazeez@gmail.com ABDUL AZEEZ P A ABDUL WAHAB

g s ; SUBIRAJ DARMARA]

3. dssubiraj@gmail.com SUBIRAID S STELLA
Tender Properties
Auto Tendering No Show Technical bid status Yes
Process allowed
Show Finance bid Yes how Bid Details in Public Technical Bid Opening
status Domain stage
BoQ Comparative Normal BoQ Compartive chart decimal |3
Chart model places J

06-02-2024 1620
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of 3

BoQ Comparative

,L Form Based BoQ No
Chart Rank Type

Tender Inviti Authorit

Name SUPERINTENDENT

Address GENERAL HOSPITAL PATHANAMTHITTA

T il

Created By SUSHAMA P K

Designation DEPUTY DIRECTOR

Created Date 06-Feb-2024 11:52 AM
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